
Lot No. Grade Weight in MTs
Highest bid 

received
Confirmation Status

CTR e-1 A 28.581 54800.00 Not accepted

CTR e-105 A 2.712 70200.00 Accepted and Confirmed

RJPT e-25 A 23.25 53500.00 Not accepted

RJPT e-27 A 20.551 52900.00 Not accepted

RJPT e-29 A 22.715 52900.00 Not accepted

RJPT e-31 A 24.743 55100.00 Not accepted

RJPT e-34 A 24.228 52500.00 Not accepted

CTR e-21 B 25.196 0.00 No Bid

CTR e-17 B 25.749 42500.00 Not accepted

RJPT e-28 B 24.588 44100.00 Accepted and Confirmed

RJPT e-26 B 26.362 44100.00 Accepted and Confirmed

CTR e-16 B 26.529 48000.00 Accepted and Confirmed

CTR e-18 B 24.021 49500.00 Accepted and Confirmed

CTR e-15 B 27.803 46100.00 Not accepted

RJPT e-36 B 20.656 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-38 B 22.357 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-39 B 25.28 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-37 B 25.08 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-30 B 18.995 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-32 B 25.305 0.00 No Bid

CTR e-2 B 24.378 43100.00 Accepted and Confirmed

CTR e-3 B 24.778 52800.00 Accepted and Confirmed

CTR e-19 B 20.438 39000.00 Not accepted

CTR e-20 B 22.145 36200.00 Not accepted

RJPT e-42 B 19.141 0.00 No Bid

CTR e-23 C 36.931 0.00 No Bid

CTR e-4 C 43.289 0.00 No Bid

CTR e-5 C 22.702 0.00 No Bid

CTR e-22 C 19.783 0.00 No Bid

CTR e-24 C 38.809 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-33 C 40.179 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-35 C 38.596 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-40 C 41.13 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-41 C 39.84 0.00 No Bid

RJPT e-43 C 41.164 0.00 No Bid

Sd. R.G. Kalaghatgi

Prl Chief Conservator of Forests (HoFF)

Result of e Tender cum e Auction of Red Sanders Wood conducted on 19.12.2016
Forest Department
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